July 6, 2006

To: Paypal Dispute Services

From: Kirsten Wellman (kwkelt@yahoo.com)

Re: Chargeback Dispute PP-180-228-411

To whom it may concern,

I discovered a chargeback on my account on July 4, 2006, for a transaction I completed in April 2006. After contacting Paypal customer service, I was instructed to send any information I had to help resolve this dispute. Please find enclosed a synopsis of the transaction, emails exchanged with the buyer, emails exchanged with another seller who is also in a chargeback dispute with the same buyer, and copies of my USPS shipping receipt. 

Before I launch into my side of the story, let me explain quickly that I have 2 email addresses. My kwkelt@yahoo.com account is the older one, and I still use it primarily for Ebay transactions and receiving Paypal payments because it is tied to my checking account. My whitehorsepro@yahoo.com account is used primarily for taking orders from my customers because it gets a lot less spam. (It’s tied to my savings account.)
So, on March 31st, Jessica Spong contacted me out of the blue (at my whitehorsepro@yahoo.com address) asking if I would sell a one-of-a-kind model horse I had on my website. We agreed on a price, and she sent me the money via her mother, Viveca Spong's, Paypal account. The email address that Jessica contacted me through and the email on the Paypal account were the same, almostgorgeous@hotmail.com. I received her payment on April 4th and mailed the item 11 days later. (I had to

wait for the money to hit my bank account before I shipped it.) I have my receipt from the USPS to prove I mailed the item as well as several of the emails I exchanged with Jessica about the horse. Unfortunately, I deleted her emails to me after she received the horse, but I do still have a copy of our correspondence retrieved from my Sent Emails Box:

Date: Fri, 31 Mar 2006 14:40:10 -0800 (PST)

From: "Kirsten Wellman" whitehorsepro@yahoo.com
Subject: Re: Lytah Bint Shahil

To: "jessica spong" almostgorgeous@hotmail.com
Hi,

I'm not sure what you're inquiring about?

Kirsten

--- jessica spong <almostgorgeous@hotmail.com> wrote:

> Im very interrested ---> Lytah Bint Shahil

> sparx@online.no Christin Brennholt ***For Sale

> $160***

> 

> // Jessica

_________________________________________________________________

> Nyhet! Hotmail direkt i din Mobil!

> http://mobile.msn.com/


> 

> 

Kirsten Wellman ~ Equine Artist

White Horse Productions

http://www.whitehorseproductions.com



Date: Tue, 4 Apr 2006 15:13:33 -0700 (PDT)

From: "Kirsten Wellman" whitehorsepro@yahoo.com
Subject: Re: Lytah Bint Shahil

To: "jessica spong" almostgorgeous@hotmail.com
Hi Jessica,

Yep, I sure do. :) My Paypal addy is: kwkelt@yahoo.com
Thanks!

Kirsten

--- jessica spong <almostgorgeous@hotmail.com> wrote:

> Hi again! Don´t know if you reseved my last e-mail,

> so I´ll send another one 

> :) Do you take paypal?

> 

> // Jessica

> 

> 

> >From: Kirsten Wellman <whitehorsepro@yahoo.com>

> >To: jessica spong <almostgorgeous@hotmail.com>

> >Subject: Re: Lytah Bint Shahil

> >Date: Fri, 31 Mar 2006 17:48:59 -0800 (PST)

> >

> >Ahhh, this mare?

> >

>

>http://community.webshots.com/photo/382041133/1394058404073264750dNGckE


> 

>

> >I didn't realize Lytah Bint Shahil was her name. :)

> I

> >bought her from Christine off mXc, and I don't

> believe

> >her name was listed in the auction. I would

> consider

> >selling her for $200 ppd in the USA or $225 ppd to

> >Europe. Let me know if you're interested. :)

> >

> >Thanks!

> >Kirsten

> >

> >

> >--- jessica spong <almostgorgeous@hotmail.com>

> wrote:

> >

> > >

> > > Are´nt you the current owner of Lytah Bint

> Shahil?

> > > Or has she been sold

> > > already? You see, I found this at webshots.com,

> but

> > > I can´t seem to track

> > > who´s the current owner of this mare, so I asked

> > > Christine, and she told me

> > > she sold her to you last fall. But maby you sold

> her

> > > after that?

> >

> >

> >Kirsten Wellman ~ Equine Artist

> >White Horse Productions

> >http://www.whitehorseproductions.com


> >

> >__________________________________________________

> >Do You Yahoo!?

> >Tired of spam?  Yahoo! Mail has the best spam

> protection around

> >http://mail.yahoo.com


> 

_________________________________________________________________

> Lättare att hitta drömresan med MSN Resor

> http://www.msn.se/resor/


> 

> 

Kirsten Wellman ~ Equine Artist

White Horse Productions

http://www.whitehorseproductions.com



After seeing the chargeback, I checked on a model horse “better business” forum I read regularly to see if anyone else in the hobby had encountered problems with Ms. Spong. Sure enough, Tara Oliver (dispute #PP-180-228-403) had also received a chargeback that same day from Ms. Spong for a horse she sold in April. Both Tara and I emailed Jessica that day to see if would shed some light on the chargeback. I have not received a reply, but Tara did, and copied it to me in an email:
From: "Tara Oliver" tara@taverstables.com
To: "'Kirsten Wellman'" whitehorsepro@yahoo.com
Subject: RE: The Jessica Spong situation

Date: Wed, 5 Jul 2006 12:08:27 -0600 
*sigh* I am SO SORRY that she is getting you too!!! Grr! I took a lot of time yesterday morning to print out and fax our e-mail correspondence, as well as the USPS Postal receipt, like you did. So let's hope this is good evidence!

I mentioned in my post an e-mail from her that I got in response to my 

"what is going on???" e-mail to her. I didn't post it word-for-word on Blab, 

But will let you see it, since you are involved as well:

"something very tragic has happened. someone fingured out my keywpord

(probobly the guy lived with in england and used my account) he was 

Addicted to poker and my mother has reported this to the police... therefor i 

haven´t been very"active" lately... we´ve lost a lot of money because of this, 

and it´s probobly therefore... Im *so* sorry, I don´t know in witch way 

this could affect people I´ve had buissness with but this is all I can say 

for now."

Like I said on Blab, I don't know *exactly* what it means.....but maybe if

it means that her ex-boyfriend was the one who is going this, and is under

investigation from the police, then maybe they will reverse the 

chargebacks. Anyway, I DID send Paypal this e-mail yesterday afternoon. I also wrote today (again) referencing your case (thank you!) and also mentioning 

the fact that both her mother's Paypal account and Jessica's e-mail address 

are the same. She seems like a nice enough girl, but that always raises red

flags to me. 

If you'd like to reference my case, you may. Here's my case #:

PP-180-228-403 .

Even though chargebacks are a difficult thing to prove wrong, let's 

Hope that we can get this resolved soon and appropriately! Thanks so much 

For writing, Kirsten!

   --tara

Tara Oliver

I am including the copies of my shipping receipt at the end of this fax. Jessica's emails gave her name as Jessica Spong(and the Paypal came through in her mother's name---Viveca Spong), but the shipping address she gave me is as follows:

Jessica Axelsson

Uvre Husargatan 10

Guthenburg

Sweden

You can find scans of the USPS receipt at the following links (in case the faxed copies don’t come through well). If necessary, I can send them via email attachments as well:

http://i83.photobucket.com/albums/j290/whitehorsepro/receipt1a.jpg



 HYPERLINK "http://i83.photobucket.com/albums/j290/whitehorsepro/receipt2a.jpg" \t "_blank" 
http://i83.photobucket.com/albums/j290/whitehorsepro/receipt2a.jpg



 HYPERLINK "http://i83.photobucket.com/albums/j290/whitehorsepro/receipt3a.jpg" \t "_blank" 
http://i83.photobucket.com/albums/j290/whitehorsepro/receipt3a.jpg



Please let me know what other information you might

need from me. You can reach me by phone at:

W: 773-702-8782 (9am-5pm CST)

H: 773-667-5962 (anytime after about 6pm CST)

Or feel free to respond via email at either kwkelt@yahoo.com or whitehorsepro@yahoo.com. 

Thanks so much!

Kirsten Wellman
