THREE players were taken to hospital with suspected fractures during last night's Soccer-Woodward ('Spurs), Forrest (Grimsby), and Hall (Chesterfield). "Badly sprained ankle" was the diagnosis on all three. They were allowed home.

THERE'S no stopping Portsmouth, A Reid goal two minutes from time increased their First Division lead to two points.
And here come Everton

(Grimsby), and hall (Chesterfield). "Badly sprained ankle" was the diagnosis on all three. They were allowed home. Wolves' revival continues. Sammy Smyth's goal gave them victory over Manchester United, the Cup-holders.

RESULTS, SCORERS, TABLES

| DIVISION | DIVISIONI

15.500 FALACE (0)1 PRINTED R (0)0 Garke Passmore 2. Small 1.101 1.101 1.101

Merrick stopped them all -except Andy Black

Manchester City 1, Birmingham City 0

Manchester City 1, Birmingham City 0

The swift-moving, goal-hungry Manchester City outplayed
the planless, sluggish Birmingham side, whose worldfamous defence was repeatedly torn to shreds by the
revitalised home forwards.
But for Gilbert Merrick, in the
firmingham goal, the Manchester can
men would have got what they
feerse who scored five goals at Be
men would have got what they
feerse who scored five goals at Be
men would have got what they
feer could have bettered, and
specific provided the state of the
when you got some idea of the
when the could have be to some idea of the
when you got some idea of the
whole you got som

r once was that supremacy firmingham fits,—Merrick: Orean, Jen usly challenged, fact, so solid was the home board, Trigs, Carrett, Hobbes



FOUR SQUARE

by Dobie's of Paisley



Germs

can't break into the antiseptic safety of an Osylised home



KEEP A BOTTLE IN THE ATTHROOM for PITTA Add; for everyday indections: for antiseptic Occip hachs.

KEEP A BOTTLE IN THE ROSPITALS HOSPITALS HOSPITAL STRUCKER A BOTTLE IN THE RESPITATION FOR ACCEPTANCE, Done launder; antiseptic, spin-bartier, borne launder; arrived to keeping floors and stenals remaitree

O.SYL ANTISEPTIC FOR GERMAFREE CLEANLINESS

Reid takes his chance

Portsmouth 1, Middlesbrough (
PORTSMOUTH, playing nothing like League leaders, sid not get their goal until two minutes from the

tenders out not get their gas until two minutes from the end.

Left half Dickinson, their outstanding player, made it.

He dropped a beautifut long pass and the grants are out on the grants before slipping it to Held way, running on sent in a shot from 15 yards that Ugpini could hardly have seen.

For the property of the grants of the g

Poethmouth, — Butler: Rooses, Ferrier Scotlar, Fjealm, Dickersoor, Harris, Barlow Reid, Phillips, Fronzatt, Middlesbrough, — Ugolini : Robinson Hepple: Gordon, Whitaker, Blenkinsopp Spunier, Dobble Fenton, Dicks, Walker.

Offers to Hernon Two non-League clubs, including inckiey Athletic, have made offers o Jimmy Hernon, Leicester City paide left, who has not yet re-



Stevens nets 30-yarder

Fulbarn. — Hinton: Freeman, Bacuzz Quested, Taylor Bezilev: Sievens, Thoma (R), Jinks, Ayres, McDonaid,

DISPUTED GOAL GIVES CHARLTON POINT

By FRANK BUTLER

By FRANK BUTLER

Charlton 1. Chelsea 1

CHARLTON ATHLETIC hung on to their unbeaten record with a disputed equalising goal by Ben Fenton 15 minutes

Jack Milburn hits

Life time.

Hurst, who had taken over the feether-shorward position to the injured a shoulder on Saurday) go on, the wing, maled the form on the injured a shoulder on Saurday) go on, the wing, maled the form on the injured a shoulder on Saurday) go on, the wing, maled the form on the injured a shoulder on Saurday) go on, the wing, maled the form on the injured a shoulder on Saurday) go on, the wing, maled the form on the injured a shoulder on Saurday) go on, the wing, maled the form on the injured a shoulder on Saurday) go on, the wing, maled the form on the injured a shoulder on Saurday) go on, the wing, maled the form on the injured a shoulder on Saurday) go on, the wing, maled the form on the injured a shoulder on Saurday) go on, the wing, maled the form on the injured a shoulder on Saurday) go on, the wing, maled the form on the injured a shoulder on Saurday) go on, the wing, maled the form on the injured a shoulder on Saurday) go on, the wing, maled the form on the injured a shoulder on Saurday) go on, the wing, maled the form on the injured a shoulder on Saurday) go on, the wing, maled the form on the injured a shoulder on Saurday) go on, the wing, maled the form on the injured a shoulder on Saurday) go on, the wing, maled the injured a shoulder on Saurday) go on the wing, maled the form on the injured a shoulder on the form on the injured a shoulder on the size of the control on the injured a shoulder on the injured a shoulder on the size of the injured a shoulder on the injured a shoulder on the size of the injured a shoulder on the size of the

Dixon had slipped through to the feft ready to head a great goal from feet ready to head a great goal from feet goals for the f

trained his come back trained by Walker, Goulden, it waited his come back trained hard, and recently receives to a 0-0 victory. Complete White Hughes Bellow White-Ker: Must, Dekt. Catching, Philosophilos White-Ker: Must, O'lling Coulden, Hughes Bellow Medium; Winder, Hughes Indured Fisher Rablist Ley Goulden, Herit, Macanley: Campbell, Willow, the Amateur Cup Bodders Hughes. Bentley, Waler, Jones Willey, Waler, Song Waler,

BRIGHTON MOVE UP

Late penalty saves Exeter

LAST season Brighton finished bottom of Division III. (South), with Norwich. Last night, at home, they beat Norwich 1—0 and thus went to within a goal fraction of top of the table. he Lancelotte. ex-Charlton r. schemer-in-chief, Brighton d promotion lootball in the half, when Willard scored

Dai Rees fails to qualify

TWO BY LUNN

ward problem. Other Exeter goals abone from Dymond and Mackasrighbs, Sears, and McNicol scored
Piffin draw of season for Millwall,
n coalless same at Bristol against
City. Ouly times goals looked likely
were to second-half efforts by Containtine and Brown of Millwall,
canthe and Brown of Millwall,
canthe and Brown of Millwall,
property of the property of the control
forward had previously driven over
from close range and then heen
ripped when going through.

Today's fixtures ASSOCIATION.—Div II; Q.P. Rangers rdix 16) Div III (S): Notic Co with 46.15—Syangers v L Orient 16 v III (N): Hull v Acctination (5) totall Cembration, Orient v Plymaulthamoton v Brichton. East Anglian C rd: Brantwood & W v Arrent 16

LAWN TENNIS.—Eastbourne Tournament Junior Championshire of Great Britain.

-Juney trainpressing of Sees Informations, SMOOKER, -- Professional Tournement thort Brown & Kingder Kenneries, Learnster mate, Hall 43 and 7,501.

SNOOKER

Ct.000 Professional Tournament (Rest. at Lecester Square Hall, London), Joh Barrie 22 frames, Albert Brown 15.

SPEEDWAY

LEAVE IT TO ROOKE

Arsenal I, Liverpool I
THE slow handclap has
I reached Highbury.
Arsenal did not deserve that,
though they played more like
strugglers than champions.
The new left-wing pair Lishman
and Vallance are not yet to improve
Lishman cidn't show the 48,000
people any Alex James tricks, and
Vallance looked better when he was
having a pon at soal than when
trying to beat an opponent.
The Liserpool to wards were not
so the service but they made express
the service but they made and free
minutes after the interval score a
fine soal, then service on to a Balmer
but the short man merely to
fire minutes later, on the one

Arsenal.—Swindin: Barnes, Smith (L) Macanias, Compton (L), Mercer; Ropes, Legie Rooke, Lishman, Vallance.

Wolves score two in minute

Hawthorn Hill DAILY EXPRESS SELECTIONS.—2.30. Tawstock (nap). 3.0. Oak Gate. 3.30. Salmon Stream. 4.0. Disobedient Miss. 4.30 Way of Gold. 5.0 Bobble's Pride.

MAN (W. KY HA)

-Selections-

THE FCOUT
2.0 Brambail
Prince (n.b.)
2.35 Felic II.
3.0 Etery 1.
3.5 Felic II.
3.0 Craign Livin
3.50 Auralia (nap. 4.10 Fair Rorach
4.10 Fair

details (c.v.).

details (c.v.).

20 Silver Bill. 2.30 Pretexter

20 Silver Bill. 2.30 Pretexter

20 Silver Bill. 2.30 Awails

20 Pretexter

20 Silver Bill. 2.30 Awails

20 Bill. 2.30 Awails

20 Bill. 2.30 Fretexter

20 Bill. 2.30 Fretexter

21 Silver Bill. 2.30 Bill. 2.30

21 Silver Bill. 2.30 Bill. 2.30

22 Silver Bill. 2.30 Bill. 2.30

23 Silver Bill. 2.30 Speciality. 3.30

23 Silver Bill. 2.30 Speciality. 3.30

O ____MILTON (5) STAKES. £580 moded 00 Panara (Baldine), 6, 9 0 ...8 Paste 92 Lynewood (Whiteley), 3, 8 9 Chapman

ACCEPTANCES

CESAREWITCH

CAMBRIDGESHIRE
CHAIGNIDGESTIRE

ond R. Moune. J. McLean, and W. J. Sas Sasker. 7 10 Scattland of the Moune. J. McLean, and W. J. Sas Sasker. 7 10 Statistics of the State of the Sta TWO BY LUNN

Lunn, roung inside forward from the first the standard from the first the first that the first the first that the

DONCASTER 1 2 3 and S.P.

GOING GOOD

2.0.—The Blends Lady (8 Smin. 6—1), ABERHANT (Oven Tuder—Russian Mahali)

No. Bid (360 Reviscot. 5—2 Einlich (The Soud) selb, 2-9 0 66a Reletards 1

—2 (1), 3. A Sci 10 Mariot Pride. 100000

1016-18 Bos. (100—5 Jacopselog. 20 Dust)

State Bos. (100

ARSENAL | ABERNANT SHOWS HIS SPEED

NOEL MURLESS considers that who won the Champagne Stakes at caster yesterday by six lengths, is the fastest horse he has trained.

Stable companion Royal Forest will go for the Middle Park Stakes, but Abernant has probably finished for this season.

Riddle-Me-Ree—
By G. H. T.

My first by the river stalks its prey.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid at my next and there is no play.

No bid

uralia has disappointed in two races but is in fine (et the Doncaster Cup (3.30) wi Newmarket Correspondent,

American column

The ballot

MALON. Tade Niss Heather (4.10) are our made the first production run of made the first production run of newsprint from 100 per cent, wheat 4.01 Institute of the first production run of newsprint from 100 per cent, wheat 4.01 Institute of the first production run of newsprint from 100 per cent, wheat 4.01 Institute of the first production run of newsprint from 100 per cent, wheat the production run of newsprint from 100 per cent, wheat the production run of new first from 100 per cent, wheat the first production run of newsprint from 100 per cent, wheat the first production run of new first from 100 per cent, wheat the first production run of new first from 100 per cent, wheat the first production run of new first from 100 per cent, wheat the first production run of newsprint from 100 per cent, wheat the first production run of newsprint from 100 per cent, wheat the first production run of newsprint from 100 per cent, wheat the first production run of newsprint from 100 per cent, wheat the first production run of newsprint from 100 per cent, wheat the first production run of newsprint from 100 per cent, wheat the first production run of newsprint from 100 per cent, wheat the first production run of newsprint from 100 per cent, wheat the first production run of newsprint from 100 per cent, wheat the first production run of newsprint from 100 per cent, wheat the first production run of newsprint from 100 per cent, wheat the first production run of newsprint from 100 per cent, wheat the first production run of newsprint from 100 per cent, wheat the first production run of newsprint from 100 per cent, wheat the first production run of newsprint from 100 per cent, wheat the first production run of newsprint from 100 per cent, which is not new first production run of newsprint from 100 per cent, which is new first production run of newsprint from 100 per cent, wheat the first production run of newsprint from 100 per cent, which is new first production run of newsprint from 100 per cent, which is new first production

4.40 PATENTIAL STATES AND ASSESSED AND ASSESSED WASHINGTON'S Munitions of the production for the sit.

1. Waster A Boxdo, 8.5 ... Never to buy German steel scrap.

22 flerif landit (Crisce, 8.5) ... Serve to buy German steel scrap.

23 flerif landit (Crisce, 8.5) ... Serve to buy German steel scrap.

24 flerif landit (Crisce, 8.5) ... Serve to buy German steel scrap.

25 flerif landit (Crisce, 8.5) ... Serve to buy German steel scrap.

26 flerif landit (Crisce, 8.5) ... Serve to buy German steel scrap.

27 flerif landit (Crisce, 8.5) ... Serve to buy German steel scrap.

28 flerif landit (Crisce, 8.5) ... Serve to buy German steel scrap.

28 flerif landit (Crisce, 8.5) ... Serve to buy German steel scrap.

29 flerif landit (Crisce, 8.5) ... Serve to buy German steel scrap.

20 flerif landit (Crisce, 8.5) ... Serve to buy German steel scrap.

29 flerif landit (Crisce, 8.5) ... Serve to buy German steel scrap.

20 flerif landit (Crisce, 8.5) ... Serve to buy German steel scrap.

20 flerif landit (Crisce, 8.5) ... Serve to buy German steel scrap.

20 flerif landit (Crisce, 8.5) ... Serve to buy German steel scrap.

20 flerif landit (Crisce, 8.5) ... Serve to buy German steel scrap.

21 flerif landit (Crisce, 8.5) ... Serve to buy German steel scrap.

22 flerif landit (Crisce, 8.5) ... Serve to buy German steel scrap.

23 flerif landit (Crisce, 8.5) ... Serve to buy German steel scrap.

24 flerif landit (Crisce, 8.5) ... Serve to buy German steel scrap.

25 flerif landit (Crisce, 8.5) ... Serve to buy German steel scrap.

26 flerif landit (Crisce, 8.5) ... Serve to buy German steel scrap.

26 flerif landit (Crisce, 8.5) ... Serve to buy German steel scrap.

26 flerif landit (Crisce, 8.5) ... Serve to buy German steel scrap.

26 flerif landit (Crisce, 8.5) ... Serve to buy German steel scrap.

27 flerif landit (Crisce, 8.5) ... Serve to buy German steel scrap.

28 flerif landit (Crisce, 8.5) ... Serve to buy German steel scrap.

28 flerif landit (Crisce, 8.5) ... Serve to buy German steel scrap.

29 flerif landit (Crisce, 8.5) ... Serve to buy German steel scrap.

YOU-in a new world . . .

A world where YOU are wanted ... First a cheerful community of companion-ship and interests as a

knowledge and skill increasing daily. Then afterwards, a wealth of opportunity to progress—to succeed—and with a personality expanded and enriched by your experiences as in no other possible career.

1 am interested in NURSE training to be a Please send me wishout obligation details of the free training for State Registration and the 1-year course for the State Enrolled Assistant Nutse (DX.29)

